WORKSHOP ON “WORLD HERITAGE: REVISING TENTATIVE LIST OF INDIA- NORTH-EAST ZONE” HELD ON 3RD NOVEMBER, 2012 AT GUWAHATI.

The Guwahati Circle of ASI in consultation with the Advisory Committee for World Heritage Matter (ACWHM) under the aegis of Ministry of Culture, Government of India organized a workshop on “World Heritage: Revising Tentative List of India- North-East Zone” at NEDFi Convention Centre, Dispur, Guwahati on 3rd November, 2012. The workshop was attended by Ms. Aruna Bagchee, Chairperson, Tentative List Working Group, ACWHM, Dr. Shikha Jain, Member Secretary ACWHM and Shri Steve Borgia, Member, ACWHM and representatives from all the seven States of North-East India. 
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ASI to unveil
Northeast's
rich heritage
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GuwanaTs, Nov2

HE Northeast will get a
chance to have more
properties forming the

part of cultural and natural
heritage in the list of world
heritage site, if Archeological
Survey of India, (ASI) Guwa-
hati circle has its way
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heritage of the region, the
ASI, Guwahati circle is going
to conduct a zonal workshop
on November 3, 2012 focus-
ing on review of existing and
proposed properties on the
tentative listin the seven sis-
ters — Assam, Arunachal
Pradesh, Nagaland, Manipur,
Mizoram, Tripura and
Meghalaya.

However, it must be noted
that the Northeastern region
has never got an opportuni-
ty to present its rich natural
and cultural heritage before
the world, and this is the first
kind of workshop initiated
the Guwahati chapter of ASI
for Northeast

T'his will be the last zonal
workshop to be organised in
a series of six consultative
workshops in  Mumbai,
Chandigarh, Kolkata, Chen-
nai, Bhopal and Guwahati on
the revision of the tentative
list of India. The results from
five of these workshops were
presented at the South Asia
Regional Workshop held in
Delhi on September 28-29,
2012. The final recommen
dations from the workshop
will be used to prepare the
revised tentative list for In-
dia by December 2012. The
workshop will be organised
by ASl, Guwahati circle and
the departmentof culture, As-
sam in consultation with the
Advisory Committee on
World Heritage Matters un-
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Stating about the objective
of the meeting, ASI's super-
intending archeologist Dr8$
Gupta said: “This workshop
will help highlight the mon-
uments and other cultural
heritage of the region which
deserve to be in the list of
world heritage site. The work-
shop will help in presenting
the unique properties of the
region before the Ministry of
Culture.”

Guptastated that only Ma-
juli in midstream of the
Brahmaputra in Assam is part
of the Tentative Listin order
to qualify forinclusion in the
World Heritage List, where-
as the region has alot of po-
tentialities in context of
unique properties consider-
ing the criteria.

Cuptasaid that 32 sites were
shordisted in the world her-
itage site’s tentative list and
8 sites have already been de-
clared as WHS.

I'he ASI has invited stake-
holders like archeology de-
partments, culture and
tourism departments, urban
development departments
and forest and environment
departments of the seven
states, besides the depart-
ment of railways and NGOs
like INTACH. Educational in-

stitutions, historians and con-
servation experts from the
seven states are also stake-
holders

T'he proposed properties in
the zonal workshop is Ahom
monuments,  Sivasagar,
Kawtchhuah Ropui-the great
entrance, Ziro valley natural
heritage {agricultural heritage
of Aptani, Tembang- a fort
village of Monpas of West Ka-
meng district of Arunachal
Pradesh and Guwahati- the
heritage city
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Maijuli’s wait for Unesco
heritage tag gets longer

POSTBUREANY
Guwaiiatt, Novs

MAJULL'S long wait for the
elusive Warld Feritage Site
tagis only getting longer

In what could be yet an
other delay, the Archeolog
fical Socicty of India is yeL
form an advisory mission for
Majul as asked by the W
Heritage Commitiee (o oo
able the commitiee (o pro
ceed for includin iver
island in the listof world her
itage site

Speaking 1o Seven Sisters
Post on the sidclines of
meeting in  Guwahat
Shikha Jain, member secre
tary of the advisory com-
mittee, said iat hings wil
proceed further once the ad-
visory mission s been
formed.

“After submissiorn of the
dossier on Majuli for in
Cluding it in the list of the

world heritage sites, we were
told that it is essent

form an advisory mission
specially for the river island
to proceed further on the
subject,” said the member

On being asked when the
mission will be formed, Jain
saidt that the Dircetor Gen
eral (DG) ASI has already
written to the workd heritage
committee regarding further
advice on the formation of
the mission. According 10 of
ficial sources, Unesco has
soughtsame more clarifica
tions and also information
on Majuli. which include de-
tailed information on the
satiras including their satcl-
lite imagerics.

A senior official of the AST
told Seven Sisters Post that
the Prime Minister's Difice
PMO) s also taking keen in.

st taking the istand (o
he prestigions listof Unesco

‘We are hopeful and alse
confident that it will be in
cluded in the list of Unesco
world heritage site v
soon.” said Jain

Meanwhile at the consul-
tation on Saturdey, official
from the archacology de
partment, cultural affairs de-
partment from all the Nos
castern states particip cd
and gave detailed presenta
tion on the sites in theiy
states which according (o
them should be given i
portance and il possible
should be declared o her
itage site
The event was 1lso attend
ed by Aruna Bagehee, chair
person, tentative list work
ing group, Advisory Com
mitice on World Heritage
Matier, and Steve Borgia
member, advisory commit
tee of wonld heritage mat
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In the inaugural session Dr. S.S. Gupta, Superintending Archaeologist, A.S.I, Guwahati Circle presented the Welcome Note followed by Inaugural Address by Shri Steve Borgia, Member, ACWHM. 
Shri Samar Ghoshal, Deputy Superintending Archaeologist, ASI, Office of the Regional Director (ER), Kolkata presented a note on ‘World Heritage an Overview- Context, Issues and Challenges & Introducing Sites from the North East India’ on behalf of the Regional Director (ER), ASI, Kolkata. 
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Stating about the objective
of the meeting, ASI's super-
intending archeologist Dr8$
Gupta said: “This workshop
will help highlight the mon-
uments and other cultural
heritage of the region which
deserve to be in the list of
world heritage site. The work-
shop will help in presenting
the unique properties of the
region before the Ministry of
Culture.”

Guptastated that only Ma-
juli in midstream of the
Brahmaputra in Assam is part
of the Tentative Listin order
to qualify forinclusion in the
World Heritage List, where-
as the region has alot of po-
tentialities in context of
unique properties consider-
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Cuptasaid that 32 sites were
shordisted in the world her-
itage site’s tentative list and
8 sites have already been de-
clared as WHS.

I'he ASI has invited stake-
holders like archeology de-
partments, culture and
tourism departments, urban
development departments
and forest and environment
departments of the seven
states, besides the depart-
ment of railways and NGOs
like INTACH. Educational in-

stitutions, historians and con-
servation experts from the
seven states are also stake-
holders

T'he proposed properties in
the zonal workshop is Ahom
monuments,  Sivasagar,
Kawtchhuah Ropui-the great
entrance, Ziro valley natural
heritage {agricultural heritage
of Aptani, Tembang- a fort
village of Monpas of West Ka-
meng district of Arunachal
Pradesh and Guwahati- the
heritage city





Ms. Aruna Bagchee, Chairperson, Tentative List Working Group, ACWHM spoke on ‘Overview of Tentative List Revision Framework’ which was followed by a presentation on “Global Strategy and Gap Analysis of the North East Zone Tentative List” by Dr. Shikha Jain, Member Secretary ACWHM. 
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The Inaugural Session was followed by presentation of all the representatives of seven States of North-East India. Dr. Tage Tada, Director, Research & Ms. Mamta Riba, Director, Art & Culture, Govt. of Arunachal Pradesh jointly presented on “ The Ziro-Talley Valey- A unique example of Ecological System being nurtured through traditional system”, Zemithang Stupa (Gorchem Chortem) as extension of Tawang Monastery proposal” and “Thembang Dzong- a fortified village of Monpas of West Kameng District of Arunachal Pradesh”. 
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For the State of Assam Dr. H.N. Dutta, former Director, Directorate of Archaeology, Govt. of Assam presented on “Sivasagar District: As a Historical City of Assam”, followed by “Guwahati: A Heritage City” by Dr. Sukanya Sharma, Asstt. Professor, Deptt. of Humanities & social Sciences, IIT, Guwahati and “Ahom Monuments, Sivasagar, Assam” by Dr. S.S. Gupta, Superintending Archaeologist, A.S.I, Guwahati Circle.  

Dr. Rajkumar Ranjan Singh, Convener, INTACH, Manipur Chapter presented his recomendation to include Loktak Wetland, Keibul Lamjao National Park, Shirui Kashung Range, Changamdabi Hill, Dhola Khal Punji, Tangjeng & Chakpi River from the State of Manipur.

Ms. Kanchani Prabha Koch, Archaeologist, Directorate of Art & Culture, Govt. of Meghalaya submitted her presentation on “Archaeological Sites of Meghalaya- Sohra (Cherrapunjee), Wadagokgre (Bhaitbari) and Nartiang” and Shri M.B.K Reddy, Conservator of Forest, Meghalaya gave his presentation on “Sacred Groves of Meghalaya-Fossil monoliths of Meghalaya’s Biodiversity-Case for NHS” for the State of Meghalaya.

Mr. Vanlalhuma Singson from the Deptt. of Art & Culture, Govt. of Mizoram presented his prsentation on “Kawtchhuah Ropui: The Great Entrance” for the Govt. of Mizoram.

For the Govt. of Nagaland Ms. V. Maria Yanthan, Joint Resident Commissioner, Nagaland recommended to include “Naga Heritage Complex, Kisama” and “Dzukou Valey & Mount Saramati including Fakim Wildlife Sanctuary” in the Tentative List. 

Ms. M.K. Pragya Deb Barman, Convener, INTACH, Tripura Chapter presented her presentation on “Pilak & Boxanagar Buddhist Complex” for the State of Tripura.

On this occasion the Guwahati Circle of ASI organized a photo exhibition also exhibiting the photographs of the monuments/sites included in the Tentative List & proposed to be included in the Tentative List.
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Apart from the representatives from the seven States of North-East India, the workshop was attended by officials from the Forest & Environment, Urban Development, Tourism, NGOs, faculties from Gauhati University, Cotton College, Nagaon College and persons from print & electronic media.

The workshop was ended with Vote of Thanks by Shri Sanjay Panda, Asstt. Archaeologist.
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